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Forces alert along Indo-Nepal border
PTI, BAHRAICH: Secu-
rity forces are on high 
alert after intelligence 

reports indicated that 
over two dozen Pakistani 
and Bangladeshi nation-

als are attempting to in-
filtrate the India-Nepal 
International Border, of-
ficials said.

The suspected infiltra-
tors are believed to have 
reached Nepal amid a 
pause in India-Pakistan 
hostilities triggered by the 
April 22 Pahalgam terror 

attack.
Commandant Gan-

ga Singh Udavat of the 
42nd Battalion of Sa-
shastra Seema Bal (SSB), 
the paramilitary force 
tasked with guarding 
the India-Nepal border, 
confirmed the reports on 
Wednesday evening.
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