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PTI, JAMMU:  A police team 
came under fire from terror-
ists in a combing operation 
in Kathua district Monday 
night, sources said.    The 
operation was underway 
in the Panjtirthi area of the 
Ramkote belt.   In the wake 
of the violent encounter, a 
night cordon has been laid 
to ensure that the three ter-
rorists trapped in the forest 
do not escape, sources said.  

Earlier in the day, Deputy 
Inspector General Shiv Ku-
mar Sharma said the oper-
ation will continue until the 
last terrorist is neutralised, 
as he urged the people living 
near the border to report 
any suspicious activities.  

"The operation is ongo-
ing, and as long as there is 
even one terrorist left, the 
Jammu and Kashmir Police 

will persevere in its mis-
sion. Our force is dedicated 
to eradicating terrorism 
and ensuring the safety of 
Jammu and Kashmir," Shar-
ma told reporters in Reasi.  

Security forces have in-
tensified their search for the 
three, bolstered by aerial 
surveillance and sniff-
er dogs. Six people were 
detained after receiving 
fresh reports of suspected 
movement involving three 
individuals believed to be 
terrorists who had escaped 
after an encounter in Kath-
ua, officials said.  

In a confrontation with 
the terrorists last Thursday, 
two terrorists and four po-
licemen were killed, while 
three others, including a 
deputy superintendent of 
police, were injured.

Cong seeks law for SC, ST & OBC quota in 
private, non-minority educational institutions

PTI, NEW DELHI: The 
Congress on Monday de-
manded that the govern-
ment bring in a legislation 
for SC, ST and OBC quota in 
private, non-minority edu-
cational institutions in the 
country.

In a statement, Congress 
general secretary, commu-
nications, Jairam Ramesh 
noted that the Parliamen-
tary Standing Committee 
on Education, Women, 
Children, Youth, and Sports 
had recommended a new 
legislation to implement 
Article 15(5).

Article 15(5) allows 
the state to make special 
provisions by law for the 
advancement of socially 

and educationally back-
ward classes, Scheduled 
Castes, and Scheduled 
Tribes, including res-
ervation in educational 
institutions, both public 
and private, except for 
minority educational in-
stitutions.

Ramesh said the Con-
gress had during the last 
Lok Sabha polls committed 
itself to bringing legisla-
tion to implement Article 
15(5) of the Constitution in 
private educational institu-
tions.

“In its 364th Report on 
the Demand for Grants for 
the Department of Higher 
Education, the Parliamen-
tary Standing Committee 

PTI, NEW DELHI: The Su-
preme Court-appointed 
National Task Force (NTF) 
has started its function-
ing and will seek public 
opinion in preparing its 
reports on tackling mental 
health issues in education-
al institutions across the 
country.

In a landmark judg-
ment on March 24, a 
bench headed by Justice 
JB Pardiwala took note 
of the recurring cases of 
student suicides in high-
er educational institu-
tions and formed the NTF 
to address the mental 
health concerns of stu-
dents and prevent such 
incidents.

The top court had also 
directed the Delhi Police 
to register an FIR on the 
complaints of the family 
members of two students 

on Education, Women, Chil-
dren, Youth, and Sports also 
recommended a new legis-
lation to implement Article 
15(5) as well. The Indian 
National Congress reiter-
ates this demand,” Ramesh 
said.

The Constitution (Nine-
ty-third Amendment) Act, 
2005 took effect from Jan-
uary 20, 2006 and this 
amendment introduced 
Article 15(5) in the Consti-
tution.

“Nothing in this article or 
sub-clause (g) of clause (1) 
of Article 19 shall prevent 
any special provision, by 
law, for the advancement 
of any socially and educa-
tionally backward classes 

of citizens or for the Sched-
uled Castes or the Sched-
uled Tribes insofar as such 
special provisions relate to 
their admission to educa-
tional institutions, includ-
ing private educational in-
stitutions, whether aided or 
unaided by the State, other 
than the minority educa-
tional institutions referred 
to in clause (1) of Article 
30,” it reads.

Explaining the chro-
nology of legislation to 
implement Article 15 (5), 
Ramesh said the Central 
Educational Institutions 
(Reservations in Admis-
sion) Act, 2006 was passed 
in Parliament and reserva-
tions for scheduled castes, 

scheduled tribes and so-
cially and educationally 
backward classes of citi-
zens in central education-
al institutions introduced 
with effect from January 3, 
2007.

Citing the case of Asho-
ka Kumar Thakur versus 
Union of India on April 
10, 2008, he said by a 
2-0 margin Article 15(5) 
is held Constitutionally 
valid only for state-run 
and state-aided institu-
tions and reservations in 
private unaided institu-
tions left open to be de-
cided in the appropriate 
course.

In the IMA versus Union 
of India May 12, 2011, he 

said, by 2-0 margin, Ar-
ticle 15 (5) is upheld for 
private unaided non-mi-
nority educational institu-
tions.

Citing another case, 
Ramesh said, “Pramati 
Educational and Cultural 
Trust versus Union of India 
Jan 29, 2014. By 5-0 mar-
gin Article 15(5) is, for the 
first time, upheld as it is 
explicitly.

“This means reserva-
tions for scheduled castes, 
scheduled tribes and so-
cially and educationally 
backward classes of citi-
zens in private education-
al institutions is also con-
stitutionally permissible,” 
he added.

SC-appointed task force starts work, to seek 
views on mental health issues of students

who died by suicide while 
studying at the Indian In-
stitute of Technology (IIT), 
Delhi, in 2023.

The NTF, headed by Jus-
tice S Ravindra Bhat, a for-
mer SC judge, comprises 
a distinguished panel of 
experts, including Dr. Alok 
Sarin, Prof. Mary E.  John, 
Arman Ali, Prof. Rajendra 
Kachroo, Dr. Aqsa Shaikh, 
Dr. Seema Mehrotra, Prof. 
Virginius Xaxa, Dr. Nidhi 
Sabharwal, and Ms. Apar-
na Bhat.

The Task Force also in-
cludes ex-officio members 
from key government de-
partments, including the 
Department of Higher 
Education, the Ministry of 
Women and Child Devel-
opment.

In its first meeting held 
on March 29, 2025, the 
Task Force outlined its 
plan to explore the root 
causes of suicides in high-
er education institutions 
and develop a comprehen-
sive report with actionable 
recommendations.

The NTF aims to assess 
current policies, review 
relevant laws, and consult 

with various stakeholders 
to create an inclusive ap-
proach to improving stu-
dent welfare.

The Task Force has been 
given a timeline of four 
months to submit an inter-
im report and eight months 
for the final report.

The process will involve 
public consultations, inter-
actions with educational 
institutions, and discus-
sions with mental health 
professionals, students, 
and parents.

The Task Force is also 
set to launch a website and 
a social media handle to 
encourage public engage-
ment and receive sugges-

tions.
The formation of the NTF 

follows growing concerns 
over student mental health 
in India, with increasing 
reports of distress, depres-
sion, and suicides among 
students in higher educa-
tion institutions.

By involving a wide 
range of stakeholders and 
fostering an open dialogue, 
the Task Force seeks to 
ensure that the voices of 
those affected are central 
to the decision-making 
process, with the ultimate 
goal of creating a safer and 
more supportive environ-
ment for students across 
the country.

Gunshots fired in Kathua 
during search for terrorists, 

night cordon laid
PTI, WAYANAD: Suhara 
Joseph, 56, was taking a 
respite from the scorching 
heat under the shade of 
a shop in Chooralmala in 
Wayanad district, blankly 
looking across the Bailey 
bridge at the rubble where 
her house once stood.

She had just returned 
from the spot where her 
home had been completely 
wiped away, with not even 
a trace left, as huge boul-
ders swept it away on July 
30 last year in the worst 
landslide Kerala has ever 
witnessed.

She reluctantly returned 
to the shade, as she was 
alone and afraid of fainting 
in the scorching sun.

“I am least concerned 
about the house and the 
properties we lost, but I 

can't get over the fact that 
the people who were so 
close to us are all gone,” Su-
hara told PTI, choking with 
emotion as tears rolled 
down her cheeks.

Suhara survived because 
she was at a hospital for 
her husband's treatment. 
All the neighbours who had 
visited them at the hospi-
tal the previous night per-
ished.

Eight months after the 
disaster, the Mundakkai 
and Chooralmala regions 
resemble a ghost town, 
with an eerie silence sur-
rounding them.

Once a bustling hub of 
tourist activity, this beau-
tiful valley in Meppadi, 
Wayanad, is now devoid 
of residents or visiting 
tourists.

Eight months on, landslide-
hit Mundakkai, Chooralmala 

remain ghost towns


